
2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

TN0330100

2000 E 23rd St19-018055 2/24/2019   6:57:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 02/23/2019 at 00:40 hours, Officer Hughes, Lance (80776) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 2000 E 23rd St. Upon 
arrival officers spoke with Derek Seretean who stated that the tag from his vehicle was stolen. It was a Colorado . He 
stated that he was unsure when or where it was taken from. Nothing further to report.

1935 Amberley Trl19-018066 2/24/2019   1:44:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/24/2019 at 01:52 hours, Officer Beavers #975 (61114) reported a disorder at 1935 Amberley Trl. Upon arrival Ms. Sherry 
Bowden and Mr. Kevin Denny had been involved in a verbal disorder. Ms. Bowden wanted Mr. Denny to leave however he had 
been drinking and was in the process of securing a ride. Ms. Bowden was also intoxicated and appeared to be acting in an 
irrational manner. Mr. Denny was given a ride by Ms. Bowden's adult daughter, Jennifer. No further police action needed.

1400 Cowart St19-018077 2/24/2019   2:50:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 2/25/19, while performing triage of the casings for entry into NIBIN, it was determined that  the initial evidence entry was 
incorrect. There were 10 casings turned in (initially reported as all 40 caliber). However, 8 of them were 40 caliber and 2 were 9 
mm. Evidence was entered into NIBIN as well as corrected on the property sheet to reflect the correct calibers and number turned 
in.

4043 Fagan St19-018096 2/24/2019   3:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/24/2019 at 14:35 hours, Officer P. McCall (0066492) reported a memo at 4043 Fagan St. At approximately 14:00 hrs, Ms. 
Joann Daniels called the police back to her residence because her grandson had returned the vehicle. Since it had never been 
entered as stolen and Ms. Daniels did not want to prosecute, there was no further action to be taken.

3613 3rd Ave19-018114 2/24/2019   8:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/24/2019 at 08:08 hours, Officer King (78347) responded to a Disorder at 3613 3rd Ave.  Upon arrival I spoke with the 
complainant, Mr. Jeffery Richardson.  Mr. Richardson stated that he and his sister, Ms. Chasity Wright, have been arguing for a 
long time now and that she continues to come on the property even though she has been trespassed from the property.  Mr. 
Richardson stated that she came into the yard this morning, started arguing, poured coffee on his vehicle and then left.  Mr. 
Richardson stated that he wanted to take a warrant on Ms. Wright for vandalism.  However when I explained to Mr. Wright what he 
need to do to take out the warrant he stated that I was not doing my job and that he did not want to go to the jail to take out the 
warrant but only wanted me to tell Ms. Wright not to come on property.  Shortly after I left the scene Mr. Richardson called back in 
and stated that Ms. Wright had returned to his house.  When Officers arrived Ms. Wright was gone but I was able to locate her 
walking past Clfton Hills Elementary School.  I informed Ms. Wright that she was trespassed from the property at 3616 3rd Ave and 
that if Police see her she could be arrested for criminal trespassing. No further Police action was taken.

512 Isbill Rd19-018130 2/24/2019   7:00:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 02/25/2019 at 07:51  hours, Officer P. McCall (0066492) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 512 
Isbill Rd. Michelle Honeycutt returned the vehicle around midnight. I received a call this morning letting me know it was returned. I 
verified the return at 07:45 hrs and removed it from the system.



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

2900 14th Ave19-018139 2/24/2019  10:05:00AM 91Z Property Found

On 02/24/2019 at 10:05 hours, Officer Tallant (61913) responded to a Property Found at 2900 14th Ave. Police observed what 
appeared to a tan purse in the road. Police secured the purse and turned it into CPD Property, (19-0889).

3550 Cummings Hwy19-018171 2/24/2019  11:29:00AM 23D Theft from Building

On 02/24/2019 at 11:45 hours, Officer W.D Johnson (66987) responded to a Theft from Building at 3550 Cummings Hwy. I Officer 
Johnson #836 visually saw Mr. Kenneth Neely walked pass all points where he could have paid for items, but he proceeded to walk
out of the door with the items still in the shopping cart having not paid. Mr. Neely was then stopped by lost prevention and given a 
misdemeanor citation, and trespassed for any Walmart store.

810 Broad St19-018195 2/24/2019   1:20:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 02/24/2019 at 13:38 hours, Officer M. Keef (62195) reported a memo at 810 Broad St. The subject, Timothy Byrd, was 
observed pan handling in front of the Vapor store located at this address. After the subject was cleared of any outstanding 
warrants, he left the area. He was given a warning and told not to return to the area. No further.

516 Terrell St19-018199 2/24/2019   1:40:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 02/24/2019 at 13:55 hours, Officer C. Darling (78384) responded to a Vandalism at 516 Terrell St. Reginald Harris stated that 
his friend/client came to his house wanting his camera back. Mr. Harris stated that he would not give the camera back and words 
were exchanged. This conversation/argument took place with Mr. Harris inside the house speaking with Mr. Lee who was on the 
porch. The screen door was locked and located between the two parties. Mr. Harris stated that Mr. Lee was very upset and picked 
up the flower pot/vase that was located on his porch and threw it at the screen door, busting out the glass. Mr. Harris stated that 
Mr. Lee then drove off. Police were unable to speak with Mr. Lee on this date. Mr. Harris stated that he wanted to wait a couple of 
days for things to calm down between his friend and himself before going further. No further

2100 Hamilton Place Blvd19-018214 2/24/2019   2:42:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 02/24/2019 at 15:45 hours, Officer Skyler Long (79892) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 2100 Hamilton Place Blvd. 
Upon arrival, I spoke with the complainant Mr. Brandon Lynn who stated his firearm was stolen out of his unlocked vehicle at work 
sometime in the afternoon.The firearm was a FN 40C handgun. SN CSU0022095. The firearm was entered into NCIC with a NIC 
#G244607124. No suspect info at this time. No further at this time.

3800 Provence St19-018222 2/24/2019   3:51:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/24/2019 at 15:35 hours, Officer Michael Hogsed (78346) reported a memo at 3800 Provence St. Police received an 
anonymous call of a red sedan that has been parked in the area of the above address for approximately four days. Upon arrival, 
police found said vehicle to be a red Chrysler 200 with . The vehicle was not a traffic hazard. Police stickered the 
vehicle and it will be subject to tow if not removed within 48 hours per TCA 55-16-103 & CCC 24-341. No further.

1001 N Natchez Rd19-018232 2/24/2019   1:00:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 02/24/2019 at 16:00 hours, Officer S.Warren (71993) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 1001  N Natchez Rd. Upon 
arrival I made contact with Mr. Gravitt, victim, who stated sometime during the early morning hours of 02/24/2018 someone had 
got into his vehicle and taken items, listed in the property section of this report, from the vehicle. Mr. Gravitt stated he believed the 
vehicle was locked but did not locate any signs of forced entry. Mr. Gravitt stated he would contact police to add serial numbers to 
the report at a later date. No evidence or suspect information could be collected. No further police action could be taken.

3449 Hall St19-018237 2/24/2019   3:00:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 02/24/2019 at 16:30 hours, Officer S.Warren (71993) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 3449 Hall St.Upon arrival I 
Made contact with Ms. Ables, victim, who stated someone had taken her vehicle some time between 1500 and 1600 on 
02/24/2019. No suspect information or evidence to collect. The vehicle was placed in to NCIC as stolen, NIC # V750965091

On 02/25/2019 at 21:49 hours, Officer S.Warren (71993) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 3449 
Hall St. At 0327 02/25/2019, Deputy Ray of the HCSO, 2E2, located the vehicle at 4000 Ooltewha Ringgold Rd. Deputy Ray then 
removed the vehicle from NCIC reference complaint number-19-002621. The vehicle was then released to the owners at the 
scene and towed by a personal tow , Expressway Towing. No further police action required.

7455 Commons Blvd19-018260 2/24/2019   3:30:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 02/24/2019 at 17:45 hours, Officer Joshua Blaine Price (76315) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 7455 Commons 
Blvd. Police responded to the Jump Park parking lot. Upon arrival, Police were met by Justin Elder. Mr. Elder stated, he had 
parked his truck and entered the Jump Park around 1530. When he left at 1705 he found that his passenger side front glass had 
been removed and placed under his truck. 
Inside his truck were three bags. Diaper bag. EDC bag. Makeup case. All of these had been taken from the truck. Items have been 
listed in the property section. Along with these items, other items were in these bags but could not give a full list since they had 
many items. They do know the Diaper bag was loaded with clothing for his wife their unborn daughter and himself. The EDC bag 
also had many items. They were carrying all of the items because his wife is expected to give birth any day.
No cameras are in the parking lot. No one around witnessed anything.
Nothing further at this time.

4702 Lake Hills Cir19-018276 2/24/2019   1:00:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 02/24/2019 at 18:17 hours, Officer Shelor, Nicholas (78349) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 4702 Lake Hills 
Cir. Upon arrival, I spoke with Mrs. Laster-Jones; she stated that her vehicle was damaged overnight. She said that she went to 
bed around 0100 hours this morning and the vehicle was not damaged. She woke up this morning and when she walked out to the 
vehicle saw that there was damage on the passenger side of her vehicle. The vehicle belongs to Volkswagon and she is leasing it 
from them. She wanted a report for the insurance. No further.

1221 E Main St19-018287 2/24/2019   7:24:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/24/2019 at 19:30 hours, Officer S. Bulkley (68389) reported a memo at 1221  E Main St. The complainant, Glenn Messer, is 
homeless and stated he was concerned that someone was going to beat him up if he went back to the homeless camp he was 
staying at. He requested a ride to 200 Market St and after checking for warrants, I transported him there. No further action was 
needed.
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2727 Rossville Blvd19-018337 2/24/2019  11:02:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 02/24/2019 at 23:03 hours, Officer Hughes, Lance (80776) reported a memo at 2727 Rossville Blvd. Officers responded to an 
assist a citizen call at the above address. Officers transported Marie Capote to her home safe. Nothing further to report.

1736 Ganasita Trl19-018416 2/25/2019   8:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/25/2019 at 08:36 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) reported a memo at 1736 Ganasita Trl. I was asked by Ms. Sutton to stand 
by while she attempted to get a tow truck to recover her mother's (Bobie Sutton) Honda CRV. Police went and spoke with the 
father, Jerrell Sutton. Police asked Jerrell for the keys, and Jerrell handed police the keys to the CRV. Police gave the keys to 
Bobie, who then left for work. Police were standing by to keep a disorder from happening.

1504 Foust St19-018432 2/24/2019  12:01:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 02/25/2019 at 09:37 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded via telephone on report of  Theft from Motor Vehicle at La 
Pachanga bar at 1504 Foust St.  I spoke with Keeleigh Ogle, owner of a 2015 VW Jetta.  She says that she left her vehicle 
overnight at the aforementioned bar  and this morning, found that the right side front window had been broken out and her suitcase
and its contents gone. She says that she does not know the cost to replace the window.  She stated that the suitcase was valued 
at $200.00 and her clothing in the suitcase is valued at $300.00.  She also stated that her adderall was taken.

1400 Market St19-018447 2/25/2019  10:45:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 02/25/2019 at 10:45 hours, Officer Moss, Mitchell (60171) reported a memo at 1400 Market St.  While on patrol I observed Mr. 
Waters knocking down road closure signs in the area.  He was stopped, FI'ed, and released after picking the sign back up.

406 S Howell Ave19-018460 2/25/2019  11:52:00AM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 02/25/2019 at 11:50 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded by telephone on report of Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 
406 S. Howell Ave.   I spoke with Alandra Garcia, daughter of Andra Garcia.  She says that sometime over the weekend an 
unknown party stole TN  off of her father's 2007 Toyota.   The plate has been entered into NCIC # P376800666.

6202 Tall Pine Ln19-018476 2/25/2019   3:24:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/25/2019 at 14:20 hours, Officer C. Darling (78384) reported a memo at 6202 Tall Pine Ln. Hermelinda Vicente stated that 
she has had some problems with a lady that attends her church. Hermelinda Vicente stated that she does not even know who this 
lady is but that she attends her church. Hermelinda Vicente stated that the lady is jealous and thinks that she is talking to her man. 
Hermelinda Vicente wanted a report in case anything else is to happen. No further
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3628 Dorris St19-018485 2/24/2019   8:00:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 02/25/2019 at 13:30 hours, Officer McCall (62872) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 3628 Dorris St. Upon 
arrival, police spoke with Mr. Mariano Hernandez. Mr. Hernandez said that he was driving home last night and drove his truck into 
some deep water that was across the road. Mr. Hernandez said that there were no barriers up at the time. Mr. Hernandez said that
he has significant damage to his vehicle.

400 BRd19-018501 2/26/2019   9:41:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/25/2019 at 13:50 hours, Officer Smith, Zachary (77584) reported a memo at 400 Broad.  Upon arriving I made contact with 
complainant Michael Deaver who stated the previous Friday night he had an accident.  Mr. Deaver stated he bumped another 
vehicle, but neither vehicle sustained any damage and the other driver left.  Mr. Deaver didn't want an accident report he only 
wanted to inform Police in case the other driver called in at  a later date.  I observed no damage to the front of his vehicle, a white 
2005 Ford Explorer TN- F02-G12.  Nothing follows at this time.

 

 

2853 Firethorne Ln19-018557 2/25/2019   3:51:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/25/2019 at 15:54 hours, Officer Johnston (75394) reported a memo at 2853 Firethorne Ln. On scene I spoke with Mr. 
Matthews who stated that he was ok. He had been on the phone with a friend talking about his divorce and had become emotional 
over the phone. Mr. Matthews stated that he was ok and that would be ok. Nothing else follows.

3624 Conner St19-018569 2/25/2019   4:20:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 02/27/2019 at 02:21  hours, Officer Dewayne Prater (60839) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 
3624 Conner St. Upon arrival police spoke with a Ms. Stephanie Mueller.  Ms. Mueller told police one day before her friend vehicle 
was stolen that she noticed two young males playing in the back yard at 3614 Glendon St.  Ms. Mueller said she was going in and 
out of her home all  day. She was working on a project in her basement.  Her friend mike has the Ring Door Bell system and he 
showed Ms. Mueller the video.  Ms. Mueller told mike that she noticed the two young males in the video.  Ms. Mueller told Mike the 
two young males were the ones playing in the back yard at 3614 Glendon St.  Ms. Mueller was very sure the young in the video 
was the same ones she seen before the theft happen.

4110 Shallowford Rd19-018579 2/25/2019   4:57:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 02/25/2019 at 16:58 hours, Officer Bell (79882) responded to a Shoplifting at 4110 Shallowford Rd. Upon arrival, I spoke with 
Mr. Randall Dill, loss prevention at Walmart, who told me that he saw Ms. Dominique Appleberry stuffing various meats into her 
purse as she went through the store. Mr. Dill told me that she went through the line, she paid for bread and milk, but did not pay for
the meats in her purse. Mr. Dill told me that he attempted to stop Ms. Appleberry as she exited the store, but she dropped her 
purse and ran into the parking lot. Ms. purse contained her wallet with several cards in her name, as well as her drivers license 
along with all the meats that she was attempting to take. Ms. belonging was turned into property under property number 19-0907. 
No further action was needed at this time.



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 02/25/2019 at 16:30 hours, Officer Day (79891) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 2285 Wilcox Blvd. Upon arrival, I 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

530 W 37th St19-018608 2/25/2019  10:00:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 02/25/2019 at 18:25 hours, Officer T. Durham (77571) responded to a Vandalism at 530 W 37th St. On this date I took a report 
of property damage from Ms. Letisha Ellison. Ms. Ellison stated when she arrived home this evening she noticed damage to the 
door frame of her back door. She stated the damage was not there when she left her residence at 1000 hours this morning. Ms. 
Ellison did not have at suspect information to give at this time. Due to lack of suspect information no warrants will be sought out at 
this time. 

Nothing further at this time.

118 Sequoia Dr19-018636 2/25/2019   7:19:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 02/25/2019 at 19:45 hours, Officer Bell (79882) reported a memo at 118 Sequoia Dr. Upon arrival, I spoke with Ms. Michelle 
Howard who told me that she saw someone looking in her window around 19:20. Ms. Howard told me that she believes it is the 
same black male that was in her car Saturday morning. Ms. Howard called and reported the incident Saturday morning, but she 
believes it was the same male. Ms. Howard told me that the only description she had, was that it was a black male in his twenties, 
wearing black pants with a white stripe down them. Police attempted to search the surrounding area for the male, but were 
unsuccessful. No further action was needed.

2528 Broad St19-018643 2/25/2019   7:30:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 02/25/2019 at 19:35 hours, Officer T. Durham (77571) responded to a Shoplifting at 2528 Broad St. Upon arrival I spoke with 
complainant, Ms. Alberta Fears. Ms. Fears stated that a black male wearing a dark gray pullover, and a white female wearing a 
light gray pullover with blonde hair pulled back into a ponytail came into the store. While in the store the two parties looked around 
and walked in and out of the store a couple of times before grabbing beer out of the cooler and exiting the store without an attempt 
to pay. These parties left the scene in a dark green Toyota Avalon heading East towards Howard High school. I then left the scene 
and searched the area for the vehicle but to no avail. At this time due to lack of suspect information no warrants will be sought out. 

Nothing further at this time.

6013 Shallowford Rd19-018680 2/25/2019   9:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/25/2019 at 21:31  hours, Officer Johnston (75394) reported a memo at 6013 Shallowford Rd. On scene at the Hardees on 
Shallowford Rd I spoke with the complainant (Ms. Buchanan - Manager) about one of her employees who was causing a scene. 
This employee ( Vernell Moore) was not wanting to work and when told that he was getting written up for not doing his job, became
very angry and started causing a scene in the restaurant. By the time I arrived on the scene the employee was already gone. The 
complainant stated that the employee had called his mother to come get him and that's when the complainant called police. The 
employees mother has been to the store several times and always creates issues. The complainant does not know the mothers 
name and wanted police on scene in case the mother showed up. Nothing else follows at this time.

 

 

600 Maple Street Ct19-018702 2/25/2019  11:07:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 02/26/2019 at 00:40 hours, Officer Buckman #776 and Officer Slater #994 reported to a Disorder call at 600 Maple Street Ct. 
Police met with the complainant, Erica Sims , and she stated to police that she kicked her brother (Isaaih Wiley) and 
his girlfriend (Destiny Edmonds) out of Ms. Sims' place of residence. Ms. Sims and Ms. Edmonds got into an argument when Ms. 
Edmonds refused to leave. Mr. Wiley and Ms. Edmonds were not on scene when police arrived. Ms. Sims told police her father 
was coming over. Nothing Further.
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4764 Highway 5819-018727 2/26/2019   1:45:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 02/26/2019 at 01:55 hours, Officer T. Perocchi (79535) responded to an alarm at 4764 Highway 58, Ankar's Hoogies.  When 
police arrived and were checking the business, they noticed the entrance door on the south side of the business was broken.  
Police also saw a tan brick that was broken in half on the ground by the door.  The glass was still intact in the frame, and no other 
doors were open while police waited for the owner to arrive on scene.  Sam Ankar, the store owner arrived and police walked 
through his store with him to ensure nothing was disturbed.  Ankar told police it appeared that no one had been inside the store.  
He also told police there were no cameras on the outside of the store.  Ankar indicated he wanted to prosecute for the vandalism, 
but there is currently no suspect information for police to follow up on.

3217 S Orchard Knob Ave19-018731 2/26/2019   6:15:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/26/2019 at 02:25 hours, Officer Hughes, Lance (80776) responded to a 911  hang up at 3217 S Orchard Knob Ave. Upon 
arrival officers spoke with Derico Ware. He stated that he and his wife had got in an argument, but it was just verbal. The wife had 
left and went to Georgia and was not on scene at the time officers arrived. Nothing further to report.

1903 E 34th St19-018732 2/26/2019   2:20:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 02/26/2019 at approximately 02:25 hours, Officer Caleb Brooks (62866) responded to a suspicious activity at 1903 E 34th St. 
Upon arrival I located Mr. Billy Webb (B/M  sitting in a vehicle with an unknown female in the driveway of an abandoned 
house at this location. Mr. Webb stated that he was homeless and they were simply just trying to find a place to sleep for the night. 
The female identified herself as Jazmine Hughes (B/F  and stated that she just recently started dating Mr. Webb. I 
checked both parties for any wants or warrants with neither having any outstanding currently. Mr. Webb did have a revoked driver's
license and was instructed that he shall not be driving. Mr. Webb gave police verbal consent to search his person and the vehicle 
while on scene. No illegal items or criminal activity was located. Nothing further.

500 N Crest Rd19-018744 2/26/2019   4:09:00AM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 02/26/2019 at 04:15 hours, Officer Calvin Cooper (#877) reported a memo at 500 N Crest Rd. Upon arrival with Engine #4 I 
observed two small trash fires  on the side of the road about a 100 yards from each other on N Crest Rd. Both fires were small and 
mainly trash but there were no witnesses and no property damage.

1330 E 3rd St19-018758 2/26/2019   7:02:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 02/26/2019 at 07:10 hours, Officer Adam Krystaponis (75508) responded to a shoplifting call at 1330 E 3rd St. Upon arrival, I 
spoke with the GM, Ms. Mandy Kane, who stated that she had confronted a customer she had theft problems with before, and 
when she confronted him, he began putting beer inside his jacket.  Ms. Kane stated she recovered the beer from him, and he left 
the store.  Ms. Kane showed us security camera footage, and the suspect was recognized as Mr. Billy Grays.  Ms. Kane stated she
would call us back if he returned.  No further.

417 Carriage Parc Dr19-018803 2/26/2019  10:03:00AM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 02/26/2019 at 10:01  hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded via telephone on report or Other Theft/Non-Specific at 417 
Carriage Parc Dr. 

I spoke with Timothy Chatmon.  He says that on 14 Feb. 2019, Fed Ex delivered a package to his door step.  He says that the 
package was from Musical Supply Company and contained a Gemini stereo. He says when he got home, there was no package at
his door step.   He says that he paid $345.00 for the stereo.

On 02/27/2019 at 14:45 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 417 
Carriage Parc Dr.  Mr. Chatmon called in to add his wife as a victim stating that the insurance company is requiring her to be 
shown as a victim since he bought it and had it shipped in her name.

7345 Lee Hwy19-018807 2/26/2019  10:00:00AM 250 Counterfeiting/Forgery

On 02/26/2019 at 10:40 hours, Officer William Bernitt (77564) responded to a Counterfeiting/Forgery at 7345 Lee Hwy at the Dollar 
General.  Upon arrival police spoke with James Lively, the store manager.  Mr. Lively stated an unknown black male came into the 
store and bought a cigar with a counterfeit $20 bill.  When Mr. Lively realized the bill was counterfeit, the suspect fled the scene.  
No other suspect information is known at this time.  Nothing further.

17930 Interstate 24 East Bound19-018819 2/26/2019  11:00:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 02/26/2019 at 11:20 hours I, Officer King (78347), responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 17930 Interstate 24 East 
Bound. Upon arrival I spoke to the complainant, Mr. Donal Colwell.  Mr. Colwell said that he was driving on I-24 East Bound when 
an unknown object came out from under the vehicle in front of him and struck the windshield on his vehicle.  Mr. Colwell then 
pulled his vehicle to the side of the road in order to make a report.  The vehicle that was in front Mr. Colwell also stopped due to 
the fact that the object flattened her tire. The driver, Ms. Cheryl Hart stated that she could not tell what the object was but as soon 
as she hit it her tire blew.  Ms. Hart stated that she did not need to make a report of the damage but she did not mind being listed 
as a witness on the report for Mr. Colwell.  No further.

216 Booth Rd19-018821 2/26/2019  12:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/26/2019 at 12:00 hours, Officer C. Darling (78384) reported a memo at 216 Booth Rd. Ida Snow stated that she had a 
plumber do some work on her house. Mrs. Snow stated that while the plumber was doing the work, she gave him a key to get into 
the house to do work. Mrs. Snow thinks that the plumber has made an extra key to her house and is bringing women over. Mrs. 
Snow has no proof of this but wanted to report it in case anything happened. No further

2008 Garfield St19-018822 2/26/2019  11:31:00AM 26A False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidenc



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 02/26/2019 at 11:07 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded to a False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence Game at 2008 Garfield 
St.

I met with Sandra Ward in the PSC lobby.  She presented documents and pictures of a scam where she friended a man online 
claiming to be Scott Kirkland.  She says that she had sent him her identity and bank information "only for trading digital currency on
WWW.kraden.com" She says that she did send him money and that now Wells Fargo has closed her bank account due to unusual 
transactions in and out of her account.  She says that she talked to the FBI and they told her she has to start with a local police 
report.  

Ms. Ward stated that she will have to sit down and determine the amount she has lost and call back with that information.  The 
information she provided has been sent to Sgt. Petty by inter-office mail.

On 02/26/2019 at 14:18 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) wrote a continuation/supplement for a False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence 
Game at 2008 Garfield St.   Ms. Ward returned to the PSC with the information on the contacts she had in this false pretense 
situation.   She indicated that she had been swindled out of $57.550.00 in her involvement.  A copy of the information she brought 
to me, is attached in investigative documents section of this report.

103 Gilmore Ln19-018838 2/26/2019  12:49:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 02/26/2019 at 12:17 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded to the PSC lobby on report of Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories 
at 103 Gilmore Ln.  I met with Katlin Cameron, owner of a 2008 Toyota Camry.  She says that two weeks ago, she was pulled over 
for having an expired license plate.  She says that at an unknown time, an unknown party stole the 2019 registration decal from the
vehicle and she did not realize it until she was stopped.

3210 Broad St19-018845 2/26/2019   1:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/26/2019 at 13:22 hours, Officer P. McCall (0066492) reported a memo at 3210 Broad St. Mr. George Atchley's case 
manager asked police to check on him.  George was calmly watching television when i arrived and spoke to me very calmly and 
clearly. I clarified with him that he was ok, did not want to hurt himself and that he did not need any assistance from police. I left 
with nothing further to report.

420 Broad St19-018851 2/26/2019   1:30:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 02/26/2019 at 13:40 hours, Officer Smith, Zachary (77584) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 420 Broad St.   
Upon arriving I made contact with complainant Steven Hill.  His vehicle had received damage at an unknown time from an 
unknown source.  With no suspect information or any idea what happened to dent his bumper, Mr. Hill just wanted the incident 
documented.  Nothing follows.

 
 

120 Market St19-018891 2/26/2019   3:30:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 02/26/2019 at 16:05 hours, Officer Robertson #652 responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 120 Market St. Dakota 
Bowman stated that while walking near the above address an unknown B/M wearing a White shirt took $15 cash ( pick pocket ) 
from his jacket pocket. Bowman gave chase but lost sight of the suspect near MLK and Carter St. No witnesses or suspect 
information.



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

601 Walnut St19-018928 2/26/2019   6:27:00PM 91Z Serving Warrant

On 02/26/2019 at 18:27 hours, Officer Moss, Mitchell (60171) responded to a Serving Warrant at 601  Walnut St.   While arresting 
Ms. Jones for separate charges, CPD #19-018813, she was found to have three warrants, HS 1694595, 1753499, 1753500, and 
was arrested on the warrants.

2020 Gunbarrel Rd19-018953 2/26/2019   7:07:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/26/2019 at 19:15 hours, Officer Kristen Thomas (80763) reported a memo at 2020 Gunbarrel Rd. Upon arrival, police met 
with complainant, Ms. Cindi Sisson, the manager at Steinmart. Ms. Sisson stated that at approximately 1900 hours, 3 black 
females entered the store. Ms. Sisson stated that the 3 females, which she stated looked familiar from previous shoplifting 
incidents, walking through the door and walked directly to the Michael Kors bags. Ms. Sisson stated that she made it a point to 
relocate to a position where the 3 females could see her, and called the police. Ms. Sisson stated that the 3 females saw her on 
the phone and walked out of the store without any merchandise. Nothing further to report at this time.

8126 E Brainerd Rd19-018972 2/26/2019   8:00:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 02/26/2019 at 20:04 hours, Officer Johnston (75394) reported a memo at 8126 E Brainerd Rd. Party called in stating that a 
white male with long brown hair, white pants, and a plaid jacket was seen walking by her store. The anonymous complainant 
stated that she believed this to be someone the police were looking for. I drove through the area and was unable to locate anyone 
matching this description. Nothing else follows.

 

 

34 Kellys Ferry Ave19-018976 2/26/2019   8:20:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 03/01/2019 at 11:07 hours, Officer B. Baker (79856) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Damaged Property Accidental at 34 
Kellys Ferry Ave.  I spoke with Mr. Randall who stated that Quality Fence came to his property and quoted him $695 for the repairs.
Nothing further at this time.

900 Mountain Creek Rd19-019024 2/26/2019  11:51:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/27/2019 at 00:05 hours, Officer Matthew Braisted (75375) reported a memo at 900 Mountain Creek Rd. I was dispatched to 
a report of a suspicious party near the trash dumpsters of 936 Mtn Creek Rd. The party was scene leaving the apartment complex 
carrying a rifle case towards 900 Mtn Creek Rd. I located the party digging in the trash dumpsters of 900 Mtn Creek Rd. I identified 
the party as Matthew Shingleton, who is a known dumpster diver in the area. Mr. Shingleton stated he had found a hatchet, a meta
club, pellet gun, and a syringe (clean, no residue). He wished to turn the items over to police as found property. The items were 
entered into property and Mr. Shingleton vacated the area without incident. No further.



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

 
 

 
 
 

 

434 Chestnut St19-019051 2/27/2019   4:30:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/27/2019 at 04:25 hours, Officer Buckman (66981) reported a memo at 434 Chestnut St. Upon arrival police spoke with Ms. 
Howell, who stated she would like to be relocated to the Community Kitchen. Police took her to the Community Kitchen 727 E 11th 
St. Nothing further.

2308 Wheeler Ave19-019068 2/26/2019   9:00:00PM 91Z Missing Person

On February 27, 2019 at 401  W. Martin Luther King Blvd. at approximately 1005 hours. Police met with Estella Moore (B/F 
12/18/1989) and positively identified her. Ms. Moore did not seem to be in any distress or require any medical attention. Ms. Moore 
stated she had gotten off work, had taken a friend to the hospital and her cell phone had died. NCIC operator was contacted with 
M425026624 as NIC number and taken out of NCIC. No further police action was needed at this time.

5348 Bungalow Cir19-019078 2/27/2019  12:01:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 02/27/2019 at 07:22 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded via telephone on report of Theft from Motor Vehicle at 5348 
Bungalow Cir.   I spoke with Benjamin Gibson, owner of a 2011  Chevrolet Silverado.  He says that his vehicle was parked in his 
driveway close to the garage and left unlocked.  He says that during the night, an unknown party entered his vehicle and stole a 
backpack which held a Dell laptop and all of his papers for filing income tax.  I gave him instruction on what he needs to do to 
protect himself from identity theft since all of his information has been stolen.

8934 Lee Hwy19-019097 2/27/2019   7:50:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 02/27/2019 at 08:25 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded via telephone on report of Damaged Property Accidental at 8934 
Lee Hwy.   I spoke with Dunnika Kirk, owner of a 2006 Chrysler 300.  She says after driving her son to school, her car started 
smoking underneath.  She says when she got back to the Super 8, where she stayed overnight, she looked underneath and says 
she saw flames.  She says that she used the fire extinguisher at the motel and put the fire out.  She says the car is not drivable.  
She says that she tried to start it and it cranked but, she could hear a loud knocking noise and it would not start.

3700 Rossville Blvd19-019099 2/27/2019   2:35:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 02/27/2019 at 08:57 hours, Officer Lancaster #308 responded to 3700 Rossville Blvd in reference to vandalism. Algaheim 
Mustafa reported that this date at about 0235hrs, an unknown white male was attempted to steal the air machine by the use of it 
extension cord. During this time the extension cord was damaged. The incident was recorded on video. Details of suspect is a 
white male with no shirt. No further to report.



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

821 E 11th St19-019101 2/27/2019   9:00:00AM 91Z Property Found

On 02/27/2019 at 09:15 hours, Officer M. Keef (62195) responded to a Property Found at 821  E 11th St. Upon arrival I took 
possession of two bags containing clothing and miscellaneous medications with the name Shannon Baker. After not locating Mr. 
Baker in the area, the bags were turned into Property under #19-0927. No further.

6914 Shallowford Rd19-019102 2/26/2019   9:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 02/27/2019 at 09:04 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 6914 Shallowford Rd at 
Surestay Plus Hotel. The victim said that he left his vehicle parked in the lot while he stayed there overnight. He last saw the 
vehicle around 9 pm last night and he had 2 bikes attached to the rear of the vehicle, which were secured with a locked cable. 
When he got back to the vehicle just now, he discovered that the cable had been cut and the bikes were gone. This report was 
taken by phone.

5323 Bungalow Cir19-019122 2/27/2019  12:01:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 02/27/2019 at 10:10 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded via telephone on report of Theft from Motor Vehicle at 5323 
Bungalow Cir.  I spoke with Amanda Courter, owner of a 2011  Jeep Compass.  She says that she had left her vehicle unlocked and 
parked in the driveway of her residence.  She says that an unknown party rummaged through the center console and took three 
pair of sunglasses and two gift cards.  Miss Courter says that one pair of Rayban are brown with black temple pieces valued at 
$250.00.  She described the second pair of Rayban as "vintage" glasses from the 1980s tortoise pattern frames with made in USA 
on the inside of one temple.  She says the third pair were basic sunglasses with round dark lens valued at $20.00.

 

400 Birmingham Hwy19-019147 2/27/2019  11:45:00AM 91Z Property Lost

On 02/27/2019 at 11:45 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Property Lost at 400 Birmingham Hwy at Covenant 
Transport. The complainant is an employee there and he said that the license plate has been lost off one of the company 
semi-trailers: 2015 Wabash Vin/1JJV532D2FL833516, .  He said that plate was reported lost to him last Monday. 
He has no idea where or when the plate was last seen still attached to the trailer and he said that the trailer is used frequently all 
over the country. Therefore, he is not sure how it was lost. This report was taken by phone.

2207 E 36th St19-019161 2/27/2019  12:20:00PM 91Z Property Found

On 02/27/2019 at 12:27 hours I, Officer King (78347), responded to a Property Found at 2207 E 36th St.  Upon arrival I spoke with 
the complainant, Ms. Victor Vicente.  Mr. Vincente stated that when he woke up this morning he observed a black and blue bicycle 
laying in his drive way.  He had never seen the bicycle before.  I picked up the bike and turned it into property and made it 
releasable to the owner.  No further.

4080 Jenkins Rd19-019164 2/27/2019  12:32:00PM 91Z Property Lost



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 02/27/2019 at 12:32 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded via email on report of Property Lost at U S Express at 4080 
Jenkins Rd.    

Jessi Whaley stated that she just recently received notice from security that 4 commercial trailer license plates are lost.  She says 
that these plates get knocked off during loading or unloading of the trailers and are never picked up or recovered.  She listed those 
plates as being .

5008 Highway 5819-019171 2/25/2019  11:00:00AM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 02/27/2019 at 12:47 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 5008 Highway 58 at 
Auto Repair OC. The victim said that he left his truck (1994 Chevy GC1, Pickup, red in color, ) there for repairs last 
Monday around 11  am and the license plate was on it at that time. The truck has stayed there since then and when the victim 
picked up the truck, just about an hour ago, he discovered that the plate was gone. This report was taken by phone. Nic# 
P096810762.

5764 153 Hwy19-019173 2/27/2019  12:51:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 02/27/2019 at 12:46 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded via telephone on report of a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 
Walmart 5764 153 Hwy.  I spoke with Edwina Burroughs, owner of a 2002 Ford Explorer.  She says that back before Christmas 
2018, an unknown party stole TN license  off of her vehicle while parked at work at Walmart.  The plate has been 
entered into NCIC # P736817389.

727 E 11th St19-019180 2/27/2019   1:00:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 02/27/2019 at 13:00 hours, Officer Jeff Kirk (60829) reported a memo at 727 E 11th St. using case# 19-019180.  I spoke to 
Sandra Muckle, she said that she got a ride with a lady and she left her bag in the ladies car.  The lady noticed her bag and 
brought it right back to her.  The lady is unknown to her.  She was worried about that the lady could have used her drivers license 
info and wanted to make a report about it.  There is no ladies info. or about the car she got a ride in.  No other actions were 
needed at this time.

2300 E 3rd St19-019191 2/27/2019   2:05:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/27/2019 at 14:15 hours, Officer Tillery (42223) reported a memo at 2300 E 3rd St.  involving a hit and run vehicle crash. 
Upon arrival police observed a silver in color Ford Taurus  parked the parking lot of the KFC of E. 3rd. The vehicle had severe front 
end damage and there was no driver or passenger around the vehicle. Police observed a drive out tag which was from Red's Auto 
located on Rossville Blvd. Police went to Reds Auto for further investigation and they informed police that there was no record of 
drive out . Police also ran the vin GA (1FAFP53UX1G141061) came back not stolen but also the previous tag had 
been transfered. Police did not receive any more call involving a traffic crash at this time.

 
 

 
 

 
 
 



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

 

 

7641 Lee Hwy19-019255 2/27/2019   4:32:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 02/27/2019 at 16:34 hours, Officer Johnston (75394) reported a memo at 7641  Lee Hwy. On scene at the Best Western I 
spoke with the complainant ( Lisa) who stated that her boss had left a note about three whites males who were believed to have 
stolen a vehicle from the Speedway next door. One of the males described in the note walked into the hotel lobby and this is when 
the complainant contacted police. I drove around the building trying to locate the white male that matched the description given but 
was unable to locate him. The party was described as a white male, bald, mid 30's, wearing a light green shirt and blue jeans. 
Nothing further at this time.

804 Broad St19-019257 2/27/2019   4:30:00PM 90Z Other

On 02/27/2019 at 16:30 hours, Officer Moses, Bobby (60170) responded to a Other at 804 Broad St. I, Moses 869, was standing 
near Ria's Market when I observed Mr. Crist (def) standing outside the market. He blocked the pathway of a pedestrian in order to 
panhandle from the individual. I reconfirmed this by speaking with the individual, as well as Crist's admission. 
D9

4715 Murray Hills Dr19-019283 2/27/2019   4:11:00PM 26A   FALSE PRETENSE/SWINDLE/CO

On 02/27/2019 at 16:11  hours, Officer Layne, Dakota (77578) responded to the Police service center. Upon arrival police spoke 
with Ms. Jones who stated that someone purchased a vehicle using her information and had the vehicle registered in her name. 
Ms. Jones showed police documentation showing that someone had been using her identity since 2016. Ms. Jones also showed 
police documentation from the DMV showing a vehicle was registered in her name using 110 N Germantown Rd. Ms. Jones 
showed police a report that Ms. Hamilton stole her identity in November 2016 that had the same address that was on the vehicle 
registration. Ms. Jones contacted Carvana who stated the vehicle was purchased on December 19, 2018. Ms. Jones stated that 
due to her being the owner of the vehicle because of the identity theft. Wanted to report the vehicle as stolen, police conformed 
Ms. Jones was the registered owner of the vehicle. Police called NCIC (NIC# V720982171) and entered the vehicle as stolen. No 
further.

On 03/01/2019 at 17:11  hours, Officer Layne, Dakota (77578) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 
4715 Murray Hills Dr. I was contacted by Auto theft investigator Cooper who stated that due to Ms. Jones never purchased the 
vehicle and the vehicle being purchased by fraud. Carvana where the fraud occurred would be who has to report the vehicle stolen 
by fraudulent means. No further.

On 03/01/2019 at 23:04 hours, Officer Skyler Long (79892) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 2000 
Hamilton Place Blvd. Police were called out in regards to the vehicle that Ms. Jones wished to report stolen was found here at the 
Regal Cinema. Police informed Ms. Jones that due to the totality of the circumstances, the vehicle would not be released to her 
since the vehicle was purchased by fraudulent means, even if her name is one the paperwork. Fraud detectives have been notified 
and are working on this case as this case is beeing handled by the Fraud Unit. The vehicle however was towed by Don Yates to 
their tow lot and will not be released until the Fraud Unit releases it to whomever. Carvana will be the actual victim in this case and 
will need to make a report. No further at this time.



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

975 Beason Dr19-019314 2/27/2019   6:50:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 02/27/2019 at 19:00 hours, Officer Luke Simon 971  responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 975 Beason Dr. Officers 
responded to a sign which was knocked down by a Uhaul. While in the area officers observed a Uhaul still on scene at 825 McRoy 
Dr. Officers made contact with Jason McRoy who was standing outside the Uhaul. Mr McRoy stated he accidentally knocked over 
the "Dead End" sign with the edge of his Uhaul truck and planned to attempt to put the sign back up. No damage was visible on the
Uhaul and the sign was not damaged, but merely knocked over. Public works was made aware of the down sign and should 
respond accordingly. Nothing further at this time.

 

7310 Standifer Gap Rd19-019326 2/27/2019   7:16:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/27/2019 at 19:20 hours, Officer Layne, Dakota (77578) reported a memo at 7310 Standifer Gap Rd. Upon arrival, police 
spoke with Mr. Miller; he stated that Ms. Gaines was following his vehicle closely. Mr. Gaines stated that when he pulled into his 
apartment complex the vehicle followed him. Mr. Gaines stated that he got out of his vehicle to confront the driver who went 
around him and parked in a parking spot. Mr. Gaines followed the vehicle to confront the driver when Ms. Gaines informed Mr. 
Gaines. Mr. Gaines came out of the residence to confront Mr. Miller for yelling at his wife. Ms. Miller heard the verbal disorder and 
called police. Mr. Gaines and Ms. Gaines both went back into the residence before police arrival to avoid the disorder. Mr. Miller 
and Ms. Miller waited outside at the mail box for police. Mr. Miller stated that he thinks he seen the magazine of a pistol. Police 
questioned Mr. Gaines if he had a pistol at the time of the incident he stated he did not. Police determined that the incident was a 
verbal disorder. No further.

16 Wert St19-019341 2/27/2019   7:51:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 02/27/2019 at approximately 19:51  hours, Officer Andrew Serret (79886) came into contact with an Improperly Parked 
Automobile at 16 Wert St. Upon making contact with the vehicle, I observed the vehicle to have a fake drive out tag, as well the 
steering column shifter appeared damaged; there was a screwdriver located in the drink holder next to the center console 
indicative to those who steal cars using screwdrivers to shove into the ignition. I observed the vehicle's doors not closed completely
with the door resting on the door jam, and the locks appeared damaged. Upon running the VIN number, I did not received a return. 
Due to the condition of the vehicle, the home owner the vehicle was left in front of not having any recognition of the vehicle or who 
the owner possibly could be, the damage done to the mechanisms of the vehicle, the fake drive out tag and the VIN number not 
showing a return; I towed the vehicle suspect stolen by Cains Wrecker at 2015 hours. Nothing further.

 
 

 

495 Riverfront Pkwy19-019364 2/27/2019   9:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/27/2019 at 21:30 hours, Officer D. Bryant (79858) reported a memo at 495 Riverfront Parkway. Upon arrival police met with 
complainant Clarence Beaman who stated an unknown man tried to maneuver his vehicle Beaman's trailer in which the unknown 
male was unsuccessful. Beaman stated the unknown male  hit his trailer and poked a hole in the unknown males bumper of his 
vehicle. Charles Hunter and David Smith were standing outside and witness the exact same account. Beamon's trailer only 
suffered a sheared screw in which he, himself was going to replace. The unknown male parked his car and went inside of the hotel 
at the above address and did not report any damage to police. No injuries were reported during this incident.



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

850 Oak St19-019388 2/28/2019   1:15:00AM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 02/28/2019 at 00:25 hours, Officer Buckman (66981) reported a memo at 850 Oak St. Police made contact with all 6 parties 
who were sitting in a vehicle . All parties go to UTC and were just hanging out for a while. No warrant on file for any 
parties.

2621 E 21st St19-019393 2/28/2019  12:04:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/27/2019 at 23:35 hours, Officer Creighton, Trevor (73490) reported a memo at 2621  E 21st Street.

Once on scene police spoke with a Ms. Karen Taylor who stated she had broken up with her boyfriend a few weeks ago and he is 
still upset about it. At this time police recieved a call stating she wanted to hurt herself from dispatch. While speaking with Ms. 
Taylor she told police she didn't want to hurt herself and just wanted her ex-boyfriend to no longer contact her. At this point police 
told Ms. Taylor to call police back if she needed any further help.

Nothing further to report.

305 Frazier Ave19-019399 2/28/2019  12:04:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/28/2019 at 00:04 hours, Officer Luke Simon 971  reported a memo at 305 Frazier Ave. Officers made contact with 2 parties 
near the parking lot of Harry's gas station. Officers observed what appeared to be a make shift camp out area directly in front of a 
"No Loitering" sign. Officers also observed a sign selling paint and other items. Parties were asked to leave and informed they 
could not solicit or camp out in city limits. The parties left without further incident.

830 Interstate 75 Sb19-019430 2/28/2019   7:00:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 02/28/2019 at 07:20 hours, Officer McFarland (62203) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 830 Interstate 75 Sb.  
Police spoke to Howard Gaffney who stated he was traveling south on I-75 when his front passenger side tire blew which in turn 
caused damage to the front bumper.  No injuries were reported on scene, Mr. Gaffney was able to drive the vehicle.

2201 Park Dr19-019441 2/26/2019  10:25:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/28/2019 at 08:04 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) reported a memo at 2201  Park Dr.  I spoke with Abigail Miller by telephone.  

She says that she stayed at he Athena from 2225 on 26 Feb. 2019 till 0900 27 Feb. 2019.  She says that a female employee asked 
to see her service dog certification papers upon check in.  She says then the following morning, the same female employee 
refused to give her management contact information, but gave her a business card for management there.

Mrs. Miller says because according to the ADA businesses are not allowed to ask to see the certification papers, she felt that she 
has been harassed and wanted to make report.  Ms. Miller says she called the Better Business Bureau and they would not file a 
claim over this.

1500 E 41st St19-019448 2/28/2019   8:46:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/28/2019 at 08:56 hours, Officer J. Billingsley (79518) responded to a suspicious person at 1500 E 41st St. An individual 
contacted the police department stating a suspicious white male, wearing dark clothing and a blue button up. The caller informed 
dispatch that he has items in storage at this business. I observed the individual inside of the lot and identified him as Ronald 
Philpott. Mr. Philpott informed me that he works for the storage company and that he is allowed to be there. I was unable to make 
contact with the owner of the business to determine if Mr. Philpott was trespassing or not. Nothing further.

3204 Amnicola Hwy19-019456 2/28/2019   9:30:00AM 91Z Property Found



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 02/28/2019 at 09:33 hours, Officer McClard (71972) responded to a Property Found at 3204 Amnicola Hwy.  Upon arrival I 
found a Tennessee driver's license and concealed carry permit inside a wallet that had been mailed to the Chattanooga Police 
Department.  There was no return address or name on the envelope.  The items were entered into the Chattanooga Police 
Property division and made releasable to the owner.  The owner is Joshua Ellison.  No further Police action is required at this time.

2000 E 23rd St19-019465 2/28/2019  10:10:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/28/2019 at 10:14 hours, Officer J. Billingsley (79518) responded to a disorder at 2000 E 23rd St. Upon arrival, I spoke with 
David Leamon, and employee of the extended stay motel. Mr. Leamon informed me that they have, at multiple times, asked David 
Sprague to leave the property. Mr. Leamon informed me that Mr. Sprague used to stay in room 107, however, after getting 
removed from the room has since been staying in room 255 with his girlfriend. Mr. Leamon told me that they have previously 
contacted the police to trespass Mr. Sprague but I was unable to locate a report documenting such. I informed Mr. Sprague to 
leave the property and that he is trespassed from the property. I informed Mr. Sprague that if he was to return to 2000 E 23rd St, 
he would be subject to arrest for criminal trespass. Nothing further.

138 Pembrook Ln19-019483 2/28/2019  11:25:00AM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 02/28/2019 at 11:23 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded via telephone on report of Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 138 
Pembrook Ln.   I spoke with card holder, Stevenson Prescott.  He says that on 28 Jan. 2019, an unknown party made three 
transaction using his Barclay Bank VISA credit card information.  He listed those as $473.50 online at "Raise" $70.00 online with 
Amtrak and he says the other transaction no longer shows on his statement.  He says the total was $1000.00.  He says that 
Barclay has already reversed the transactions off of his account, but are now asking for a police report to be made.

2006 Hamilton Place Blvd19-019490 2/25/2019  10:00:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 02/28/2019 at 11:51  hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 2006 Hamilton Place Blvd 
at Old Chicago Pizza. The victim said that he last saw his car (2015 VW Golf, blue in color) without damage when he parked it in 
the lot there last Monday night around 10 pm. When he got back to the car around 11:30 pm, he discovered that there was a large 
dent in the driver side front fender and there was some white paint around the dented area. He said that there was a white truck 
parked next to his car at the time when he first parked there. However, he did not see the incident and he there is no video 
cameras there that he knows of. Therefore, there is no proof at this time of what actually caused the damage or as to whether or 
not it was intentional or accidental. I observed the damage which appeared to be well over $500 worth. He has not yet gotten an 
estimate. This report was taken in the PSC Lobby.

832 Georgia Ave19-019501 2/28/2019  12:03:00PM 250 Counterfeiting/Forgery

On 02/28/2019 at 12:17 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Counterfeiting/Forgery at 832 Georgia Ave at Fontaine 
Investments, LLC. The complainant is a Property Manager there and he said that his company sent a check to a client recently 
who never received it. It was sent by mail to: . Later, the company was notified that the check 
had cleared the bank and had been cashed illegally at an unknown location by an unknown person. The complainant showed me 
the check, with  for $525.00, which had been illegally altered with the following information: Pay to the order of: "Larry 
Davis",  with unknown signature on back.  He said that his company has no idea who Larry Davis is and that's not the name of the 
person who was supposed to receive the check. He said that someone had whited out the client's name to write in "Larry Davis" in 
place of it.  He said that the bank can not tell him where the check was cashed at this time. This report was taken in the PSC 
Lobby.

1100 Market St19-019546 2/27/2019  10:45:00AM 23D Theft from Building



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 02/28/2019 at 14:49 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Theft from Building at 1100 Market St at TVA Edney 
Innovation Center. The victim said that she was there yesterday and she had layed her keys down in her seat and they were on a 
UTC lanyard. She said that she stepped away from her seat for about 15 minutes between 10:45 & 11  am. When she got back to 
her seat, she discovered that the lanyard was gone. This report was taken by phone.

400 Workman Rd19-019549 2/28/2019   2:09:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 02/28/2019 at 18:23 hours, Officer Ty cooper 821  (43380) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Vehicle Recovered Stolen 
Outside of Chattanooga at 400 Workman Rd. 

The photo evidence collected from the witness was added to this report for further follow up by the agency (Scottsboro Alabama 
PD) that is investigating the incident. If needed we will assist the agency with any follow up if requested.

W Bell Ave//Spears Ave19-019583 2/28/2019   4:35:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 02/28/2019 at approximately 16:45 hours, Officer Andrew Serret (79886) responded to Suspicious Activity at W Bell Ave / 
Spears Ave. At the time of dispatch, I was informed that a White male, in a black two door sedan was following a white female who 
was on foot walking east on Bell Ave towards the North River Grocery at the corner of Bell and Spears. The white male was 
reported to have been wearing dark clothing, like a uniform. The white male was also reported trying to "pick up" the female but 
that the female kept running towards to the store. Upon arrival, I did not observe any behavior of such and heard no sounds of 
distress. I am documenting what was reported in case such behavior continues or is reported. Nothing further.

 
 

209 Croll Ct19-019639 2/28/2019   7:10:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/28/2019 at 19:30 hours, Officer D. Bryant (79858) reported a memo at 209 Croll Ct. Upon arrival police met with 
complainant Jacqueline Barber who stated her son (Cedric Cross) ask to come over and wash his clothes. Barber stated after 
washing his clothes he would not leave. Police spoke with cross who stated he did not have a ride to his room at Chatt Inn. Police 
transported cross to Chatt Inn. No injuries were reported during this incident.

3000 Wilcox Blvd19-019654 2/28/2019   7:50:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 02/28/2019 at 19:50 hours, Officer Joshua Blaine Price (76315) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 3000 Wilcox 
Blvd. While on patrol I came across a tree down at the Wilcox Tunnels. Upon inspection, it was found that when the tree fell, it 
made contact with a Vehicle. Limbs struck the front bumper. It appeared to knock the bumper loose and do some paint damage. 
No major damage. Vehicle was driven from the scene with no issue.
Nothing further at this time.

2020 Gunbarrel Rd19-019664 2/28/2019   6:48:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 02/28/2019 at 20:20 hours, Officer Layne, Dakota (77578) responded to a Shoplifting at 2020 Gunbarrel Rd.  Upon arrival 
police spoke with Ms, Kendrick who stated an unknown black male entered the store and selected miscellaneous items from the 
store. The unknown male walked up to the counter and gave the employee his phone number the unknown male then picked up 
the clothing and ran out the door passing all points of sale. Ms. Kendrick stated that she got the tag number of the vehicle the 
unknown male ran to  Ms. Kendrick stated it was unknown how much merchandise was stolen but estimated the value to 
be around $300. There is no surveillance at the business. No further.



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

2020 Gunbarrel Rd19-019674 2/28/2019   7:30:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 02/28/2019 at 20:45 hours, Officer Layne, Dakota (77578) responded to a Shoplifting at 2020 Gunbarrel Rd. Upon arrival police 
spoke with Mr. Wall the manager at Cricket wireless he stated that a black male and a black male dressed as a women came into 
the store. Mr. Wall stated they asked to see phones that they did not have in stock. Mr. Wall stated that the male asked to see the 
LG phone. Mr. Wall stated got the phone out of the box and was holding the phone in his hand when the unknown black male took 
the phone and ran out the door. Mr. Wall provided police with the serial number for the phone. Mr. Wall stated there is surveillance 
at the location but he did not have access to the video at this time. No further.

4704 Rossville Blvd19-019679 2/28/2019   9:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/28/2019 at 21:15 hours, Officer Ampthor (73492) reported a disorder at 4704 Rossville Blvd. The manager, Ms. Angel 
Payne, has had issues with a customer on a regular basis.  The customer drives a newer Chevrolet Spark (  and is 
describes as a black female with freckles on her face with short black hair.  The customer has caused a number of disorders which
have come from issues with her order.  On this date the customer got upset with her drinks and poured them over the counter.  
Once outside the business, the customer threw things and kicked the door.  Ms. Payne wished to have the party trespassed from 
the property due to the regular issues the customer has when present.  Police attempted to locate the customer at this time based 
of the description and vehicle registration but were unable to locate her at this time.  No further police action was able to be taken.

 

 

2301 Elmendorf St19-019718 2/28/2019  11:40:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 02/28/2019 at 23:45 hours, Officer Sanchez (73514) reported a memo at 2301  Elmendorf St. Upon arrival I spoke with the 
complainant, Tanya Brown ), who explained that she was in a verbal disorder with her daughter, Nikita Hale  

). Tanya stated that she and Nikita were arguing over various problems, and eventually Tanya went into her room and shut 
the door. Nikita came to Tanya's door and demanded to be let in so that she can retrieve the keys to the car and leave. Tanya 
stated that Nikita could not take the car as the car is in Tanya's name and does not belong to Nikita. At that point Nikita barged into 
the room and began rummaging through Tanya's belongings. Tanya told Nikita to leave the room multiple times, but Nikita failed to 
do so. Tanya then began pushing Nikita out of the room, and Nikita pushed back. That is when Tanya left the room and called 
police.
I then spoke with Nikita, who corroborated Tanya's story, stating that she needed the car because she did not want to be there. It 
was found that Nikita does not have a valid driver's license so she would not be driving. Nikita stated that she just wanted to go to 
her room for the night, and Tanya stated she wanted to be left alone as well. Both parties were separated and they each stated that
they would leave the other alone for the night. Because there was no physical harm done to either party, the primary instigator is 
unclear, and the disorder was primarily verbal, there is no police action required.



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

4802 Winding Ln19-019756 3/1/2019   3:06:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 3-1-19 around 03:06 hours I Ofc. Allison #237 was dispatched to 4802 Winding Ln a single vehicle crash. On scene I made 
contact with complainant William Foster and his Volvo S60 with a tire stuck in a ditch. Mr. Foster contacted his own tow company 
to remove the vehicle from the ditch. There was no damage to the vehicle and Mr. Foster did not want a crash report completed.

201 Browns Ferry Rd19-019759 2/28/2019  12:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/01/2019 at 03:23 hours, I, Officer David Schuerger #805 responded to suspicious activity at Mapco 201  Browns Ferry Road, 
Chattanooga.

When I arrived, I spoke with Katie McCary (clerk/Complainant) stated that a guy named George was at her job when she showed 
up. She knows Mr. George because he has given her rides to work before. She stated that George was outside since around 
midnight watching her from his vehicle with binoculars and he came inside and stated I've been watching you. 

Ms. McCary stated that she called her husband to come out there because she was freaked out. Police checked the area but did 
not located Mr. George.

Officer Schuerger #805



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

 

7500 Shallowford Rd19-019783 3/1/2019   6:20:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/01/2019 at 06:35 hours, Officer Brumbaugh (66622) reported a memo at 7500 Shallowford Rd. Ms. Frankie Ricks was 
stopped in the roadway near the 7500 block of Shallowford Rd. in her Nissan Altima. She informed me that she doesn't see well at 
night and she seemed a little disoriented, so I asked her to follow me to a nearby gas station where she could wait for it to lighten 
up. I left her in the parking lot of Kanku's at Jenkins and Shallowford Rd. She said that she knew where she was and would take 
Jenkins Rd. to her house in Ooltewah when she could see better. No further police action was needed.

2000 E 23rd St19-019789 3/1/2019   6:53:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/01/2019 at 06:45 hours, Officer Creighton, Trevor (73490) reported a memo at 2000 E 23rd Street Apt #105.

Once on scene police spoke with a Mr. Jerome Marsh who was located inside the above stated room. At this point Mr. Marsh was 
run for warrants with negative findings. Mr. Marsh then stated he and his girl friend had been arguing earlier and he believes she 
may have called on him. Mr. Marsh then stated he didn't need any help from police.

Nothing further to report.

3107 Lookaway Trl19-019790 3/1/2019   2:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/01/2019 at 06:45 hours, Officer Sanchez (73514) reported a memo at 3107 Lookaway Trl. Upon arrival I spoke with the 
complainant, Meagan Herrera  who explained that her ex-boyfriend, Talley Cagle ), had been at the 
house all morning shouting. Meagan stated that she ignored the shouting, and called police only when Talley woke other members 
of the residence. I then spoke with Talley, who stated that he walked over to Meagan's house in order to retrieve his XBOX gaming 
console. Talley explained that he wanted his property and then he would leave and not cause any more issues. Meagan then gave 
Talley his XBOX and he left the area. Both parties explained that there was no physical altercation, it was only verbal. There is 
nothing further.

7641 Austin Dr19-019811 3/1/2019  12:01:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 03/01/2019 at 08:04 hours, Officer Glenn (60757) responded via telephone on report of Theft from Motor Vehicle at 7641  
Austin Dr.

I spoke with Tammy Gasaway, owner of a 2004 Nissan Quest.  She says that sometime during the night, an unknown party broke 
out the left side front window and stole her pocketbook and its contents.  She says that she does not know the cost to replace the 
window.

 

 

  

 



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

 
 

 

 

 

 
 

142 Dal Brown Rd19-019952 3/1/2019   4:15:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/01/2019 at 16:34 hours, Officer Luke Simon 971  responded to a vicious animal at 142 Dal Brown Rd. Upon arrival officers 
were able to locate the animal which was a brown in color pit bull. Officers were able to determine the dog was not violent or 
aggressive. Nothing further at this time.

4715 Bonny Oaks Dr19-019967 3/1/2019   4:55:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 03/01/2019 at 16:56 hours, Officer Shelor, Nicholas (78349) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 4715 Bonny Oaks Dr. 
Upon arrival, I spoke with Mr. Anthony Eddins; he stated that someone stole the tag of his vehicle that his parked in front of his 
apartment. He said that around February 18th he was out of town and when he returned he found that his tag was taken off of his 
vehicle. He said that he did not know who may have taken the tag and provided a VIN number and it came back to TN  

. The tag was then imported to NCIC under NIC number P096814366. No further.

 

 
 

.

18500 Interstate 24 Eb Rd19-020059 3/1/2019   9:54:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 03/01/2019 at 21:54 hours, Officer Joshua Blaine Price (76315) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of 
Chattanooga at 18500 Interstate 24 Eb  rd. While on Patrol on I-24 Eb, I was alerted to a stolen auto by my ALPR. I got behind the 
vehicle at the 185 I-24 Eb and had dispatch verify the info. It came back stolen. Vehicle went south on I-75. Vehicle then took the 
East Ridge exit and pull into Mapco gas station at 6514 Ringgold Rd. 
Brandon Dison-Driver. Margot Cross-Passenger. Elmore Dison-Passenger.
Dispatch contacted the reporting department. 
Vehicle was towed by Guy Yates.
Vehicle location was sent to the reporting agency.
Nothing further at this time.

 
 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 

212 Georgia Ave19-020096 3/1/2019  11:39:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/01/2019 at approximately 23:39 hours, Officer Andrew Serret (79886) initiated a Traffic Stop with a Nissan Sedan displaying 
TN  at 212 Georgia Ave due to observing the defendant make a U turn on the veterans bridge, crossing multiple lanes 
of traffic unlawfully. Upon making contact with the driver I was informed that the driver was a Lyft Driver and that he made the U 
turn to get to a passenger he needed to pickup. The driver was identified as Zachary Ware ) and I informed him that 
his maneuver especially at nighttime when people try to speed across the bridge was very unsafe not just unlawful. Zachary had 
also forgotten his license at home but is showing to have a valid drivers license for the state of Tennessee. At this time, I issued 
Zachary a warning as his Motor Vehicle Record does not show him to be a habitual offender for traffic offenses. But I informed 
Zachary that this report will be made and that Zachary's name will show as having a Watson report completed; addressing his 
traffic violations tonight. Nothing further.

2727 Rossville Blvd19-020128 3/2/2019   2:54:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/02/2019 at 02:54 hours, I FTO Angel #330 conducted a Field Interview at 2727 Rossville Blvd, Mapco. I observed Isaac 
Burney and Joel Sandridge loitering on the parking lot and causing a disturbance with the patrons at the listed address. Contact 
was made and both parties were checked for warrants. Both parties came back with a negative return and they walked to the 
Hamilton Inn after police contact. Nothing further at this time.

600 S Holly St19-020188 3/2/2019   9:20:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 03/02/2019 at 09:30 hours, Officer Hicks (68400) was flagged down while on patrol in the area of 600 S Holly St by a resident 
of 1513 Union Ave. Police were asked who was responsible for towing a blue Chevy Avalanche that had an orange sticker issued 
by CPD on the window from approx. one month ago. Police arranged for Mostellers #2 to tow the vehicle. The vehicle had flat tires 
and expired registration from 2017.

920 W 37th St19-020210 3/2/2019  10:56:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/02/2019 at 10:57 hours, Officer Jacob Retchko (66992) and Officer Noakes (706) reported to an unknown 911  call at 920 W 
37th St. Upon arrival police were able to narrow down the location of the call from an alarm coming from a van located in front of 
the residence and what sounded like an argument coming from the home. Police were then able to make contact with a Janet 
Jones,  At this time Ms. Jones informed police that she and her boyfriend Conie Hutchinson,  were just 
arguing and were in no danger or required medical assistance. Upon contact with Mr. Hutchinson this was confirmed. Both parties 
informed police that the argument was over and shouldn't re-occur. No further action was taken.

330 Thompson St19-020240 3/2/2019  11:55:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/02/2019 at 11:55 hours, Officer Orsburn#662 (66495) reported a memo at 330 Thompson St. 
  While on patrol I observed a Silver Oldsmobile Tn  parked facing the wrong direction at 330 Tremont St.  All the tires 
were flat on the vehicle and the registration expired in Aug of 2018. I put a orange sticker on the vehicle and will Tow the vehicle in 
a few days if it is not moved due to it appearing abandoned.

1100 Carter St19-020265 3/2/2019  10:30:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 03/02/2019 at 13:10 hours, Officer D. Russell (63833) responded to a Vandalism at 1100 Carter St. Upon my arrival I made 
contact with Mrs. Tillman who stated that she parked her Ford Edge in the parking garage of the convention center at around 
1030hrs this morning. Mrs. Tillman stated that when she returned to her vehicle around 1300hrs this date she found a long scratch 
on the drivers door which appeared to be from a key. There is no suspect information or anything to process. Mrs. Tillman stated 
that she does not know anyone from the area so she is not sure why her vehicle was targeted. No further.

 
 

 

 

 
 

7354 E Brainerd Rd19-020318 3/2/2019   5:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 03/02/2019 at 17:35 hours, Officer Springer (66500) reported a memo at 7354 E Brainerd Rd. Upon arrival police spoke with 
Eddie Nation. He stated he did some car repairs for his girlfriend Lori Gage. He told her he would accept $100 and taking him to 
eat as payment. He said they went to eat and Lori stopped at an ATM and gave him $100. While driving she told him she needed 
some of the money back. He told her he could not because he had to give some of the money to his business partner. He said Lori
became upset and started tapping him in the face and yelling at him. Eddie did not have any marks on him. He said she was not 
tapping him hard. He had her pull over and he got out of her vehicle. She then drove off. Eddie stated Lori was drunk and should 
not be driving. Dispatch put out a bolo for her vehicle. Eddie still had the $100 Lori gave him. Nothing further.

314 Mcbrien Rd19-020331 3/2/2019   6:31:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/02/2019 at 18:31  hours, , I, Ofc. Gunn 351, responded to a call of a Disorder at 314 McBrien Rd (Apt. B27). The details of 
the call, as police were en route, stated that a female with red pants was hitting the door of B27 with her fists and kicking the door 
with her feet. Upon arrival, police were able to make contact with the said female, Dabrecia Lomnick. I went to , and I 
could see that there were holes in the door. No one opened the door of  and no reporting party/victim could be contacted. At 
that time, Ms. Lomnick was let go. Nothing further

 
 

 

2340 Shallowford Village Dr19-020335 3/2/2019   5:45:00PM 23D Theft from Building

On 03/02/2019 at 18:52 hours, Sgt Ric Engle (60825) responded to a Theft from Building at 2340 Shallowford Village Dr.  The 
victim, Travis Lindsey, wanted police to call him regarding a stolen wallet.

I called the victim and he told me he was in O'Charley's at or about 1745.  Between that time and 1800 the victim lost his wallet.  
An unknown person got the wallet and did not return it.  The victim needed to make a theft report.  The wallet contained the items 
listed in the property section.  The victim was in the process of canceling his credit cards when I called.  No other police action 
taken at this time.

 
 

 
 

 
 

  
 

7026 E Brainerd Rd19-020356 3/2/2019   8:07:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



2/24/2019  12:00:21AM TO 3/2/2019  11:00:21PM

On 03/02/2019 at 20:20 hours, Officer Springer (66500) reported a Business Alarm at 7026 E Brainerd Rd (Subway). Upon arrival 
police found an unlocked door on the side of the business. No one was found inside. A note was found laying on the register. The 
note was from an employee that said they were sick and left. The side door was not able to be locked. The manager for the store 
Alex was notified by phone. She told police to just push the door closed and she would get someone to respond to the restaurant. 
Nothing further.

3401 Campbell St19-020360 3/2/2019   9:05:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/02/2019 at 20:25 hours, Officer Cooke (78367) reported a memo at 3401  Campbell St. Police were dispatched to a noise 
complaint, Upon Police arrival Police could not hear any noise coming from apartment 206. Police spoke with complaint in 
apartment 205 a Ms. Linda Benning who stated she has on going issues with the tenants in apartment 206. Ms. Benning stated 
that she heard loud crashes coming from the apartment above her. Police attempted to make contact with the tenant in 206 but 
was unable to make contact. Police have nothing further at this time.

 

5311 Hwy 5819-020377 3/2/2019   7:00:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 03/02/2019 at 22:05 hours, Officer Harvey,Charles (66485) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 5311  Hwy 58.   Police 
spoke to Ms. Conyers by phone after she called asking for an officer to give her call concerning the theft of her freezer.  Ms. 
Conyers stated she had just moved in to this apartment and was organizing things and had her deep freezer sitting on the back 
porch and that when she went out to start cleaning it it was no longer on her back porch.  Ms. Conyers stated the last time she saw
the freezer was around 1900hrs on this date and that she hadn't left the residence in between.  There was no suspect information.

2350 Shallowford Village Dr19-020378 3/2/2019  10:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/02/2019 at 22:40 hours, Officer Brumbaugh (66622) reported a memo at 2350 Shallowford Village Dr. Lashanna 
Middlebrooks called police after she got into a disorder with a customer, Timothy Stitts. Stitts was denied a room key because it 
was his wife's name on their room instead of his, and this led to both parties and Stitt's wife getting into a heated arguement. 
Middlebrooks asked the Stitts' to leave, and they will seek reimbursement with management. Police assisted the Stitts' to their 
room to get their things. No further police action was needed.

3600 Lightfoot Mill Rd19-020389 3/2/2019  11:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/02/2019 at 23:40 hours, Officer Kaumer Hughes (0062192) reported a memo at 3600 Lightfoot Mill Rd.  Front end of the 
vehicle was stalled in water on side of the road, abandoned, and presented a traffic hazard for being partially in the roadway.  No 
further.




